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Safari Collection by DMDIO Studio

<p><style type="text/css"></style><span style="font-
family:Calibri,Arial;font-size:11pt;"><span style="font-
style:normal;text-align:center;" data-sheets-root="1">The
Safari Collection is inspired by the vast and untamed
landscapes of the savannah. Its design elements capture
the essence of open plains, earthy warm tones, and the
balance between resilience and comfort. With clean lines
and sturdy forms, this collection evokes a sense of
exploration and freedom, bringing the experience of
unwinding in the heart of the savannah directly to your
outdoor space.</span></span><br><br><span style="font-
family:Calibri,Arial;font-size:11pt;"><span style="font-
style:normal;text-align:center;" data-sheets-
root="1">Every detail in this collection is crafted to offer an
authentic connection with the outdoors. From comfortably
designed chairs and spacious sofas to organically shaped
tables, each piece encourages a seamless interaction with
nature, making every moment spent outside feel effortless
and inviting.</span></span></p>

  

<ul><li>Table top and base Solid teak wood FSC
100%</li><li>Ice cube Aluminium powder
coating</li><li>Fittings Stainless steel 304</li><li>Glides
PA rubber</li><li>Dining tables Include
adjusters<br>Packaging Carton box double wall K275,
plastic free</li></ul>
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